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Bid Tabulation 
Guilford County Schools 
Bid # 5632 
AV Equipment  

 
 
Qt
y. 

 
 
Description 

 
 
Perlmutter 
Purchasing 

 
 
Business 
Services 
 

 
 
Troxell 
Comm. 

 
 
CDW-G 

 
 
All In One 

 
 
Adorama 
Inc. 

 
 
Valiant 
National 

 
 
Washingto
n 
Pro. 
Systems 

 
 
2 

 
 
Road ready Cases Slant 
Rack  
 
16U RRM16UW 

 
 
 
429.00 

 
 
 
498.98 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
449.00 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
459.00 

 
 
4 

 
 
Rapco Road Hog 
Microphone Cable, 6’ 
HOGM6 

 
 
13.00 

 
 
24.98 

 
 
18.59 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
19.00 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
16.00 

 
4 

 
Shure Wireless Microphone 
System ULXS124/85 
 

 
 
770.00 

 
 
979.98 

 
 
762.93 

 
 
1,242.29 

 
 
949.00 

 
 
840.00 

 
 
796.00 

 
 
843.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Shure Dual Rack Mount  
 
Hardware UA507 

 
 
 
 
23.00 

 
 
 
 
35.98 

 
 
 
 
25.55 

 
 
 
 
23.45 

 
 
 
 
29.00 

 
 
 
 
26.00 

 
 
 
 
24.70 

 
 
 
 
19.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Canon VIXIA HF R40 Flash  
 
Camcorder 8153B001 
 

 
 
 
 
329.00 

 
 
 
 
248.98 

 
 
 
 
266.87alt. 

 
 
 
 
394.99 
alternate 

 
 
 
 
399.00 

 
 
 
 
279.00 

 
 
 
 
269.00 

 
 
 
 
314.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Promaster 16GB SDHC 
Class 6  
 
Card 9233 – 
 
 

 
 
 
 
34.95 

 
 
 
 
No bid 
 

 
 
 
 
22.94 

 
 
 
 
8.56 
Not spec. 

 
 
 
 
39.00 

 
 
 
 
12.95 
Not spec. 

 
 
 
 
9.85 
Not spec. 
 

 
 
 
 
29.00 

 
 
4 

 
 
Sony Tripod VCT R100 

 
 
24.00 

 
 
42.98 

 
 
33.23 

 
 
28.00 

 
 
29.00 

 
 
27.00 

 
 
29.34 

 
 
38.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
DBX Digital processor PA 

 
 
319.00 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
403.18 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
429.00 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
394.00 

 
 
4 

 
 
JBL Speakers-AC18/95 
Chorus/Band 

 
 
 
575.00 

 
 
 
939.98 

 
 
 
609.02 

 
 
 
807.97 

 
 
 
979.00 

 
 
 
647.00 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
609.00 

 
 
4 

 
 
JBL Speakers-GYM 
AM5215/95 

 
 
 
 
985.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1048.76 

 
 
 
 
1,992.92 

 
 
 
 
1,199.00 

 
 
 
 
1,142.00 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1,082.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
JBL Speakers-Subwoofer  
 
ASB4128 

 
 
 
 
1,398.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1505.24 

 
 
 
 
1,760.48 

 
 
 
 
1,699.00 

 
 
 
 
1,599.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1,537.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Vaddio Production View 
Super  
 
Joystick 9995300000 

 
 
 
 
 
1,395.00 

 
 
 
 
 
1,539.98 

 
 
 
 
 
1537.98 

 
 
 
 
 
1,604.96 

 
 
 
 
 
1,699.00 

 
 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
 
1,414.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Vaddio Quick-Connect 4 
 
9995100000 

 
 
 
 
480.00 

 
 
 
 
489.98 

 
 
 
 
489.01 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
599.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
490.00 



 
 
 
                                          

2 

 
 
4 

 
 
Vaddio Model 100 PTZ 
Camera  
 
Kit 9992001100 

Perlmutter 
 
 
 
 
885.00 

Business 
 
 
 
 
 
929.98 

Troxell 
 
 
 
 
919.97 

CWG 
 
 
 
 
No bid 

All in One 
 
 
 
 
1,179.00 

Adorama 
 
 
 
 
No bid 

Valiant 
 
 
 
 
No bid 

Washingt
on 
 
 
 
 
921.00 

 
 
2 
 

 
 
StarTech 1U 19” Rack 
Mount  
 
LCD KVM- 1UCABCONS19 

 
 
1,029.00 

 
 
1,029.98 
 

 
 
1076.73 

 
 
1097.01 

 
 
1,199.00 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1,132.00 

 
 
2 
 

 
 
Totevision 12.1” Rack 
Mount Monitor with Tuner  
 
LED-1212TR 

 
 
 
 
$568.00 

 
 
 
 
589.98 

 
 
 
 
538.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
659.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
584.00 

 
 
 
 
2 

 
 
 
 
APC NetShelter SX 42U 
600mm x 1200mm  
 
AR3300 

 
 
 
 
$1,630.00 

 
 
 
 
1,629.98 

 
 
 
 
1476.45 

 
 
 
 
1495.63 

 
 
 
 
1,699.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
1,435.00 

 
 
 
 
1,698.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
APC Rack PDU, Basic, OU,  
 
15A, 120V, 5-15 AP9567 
 
 

 
 
 
 
$135.00 

 
 
 
 
149.98 

 
 
 
 
152.78 

 
 
 
 
139.52 

 
 
 
 
159.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
152.60 

 
 
 
 
159.00 

 
 
8 

 
 
Middle Atlantic Shelf U2 
 
 

 
 
$41.25 

 
 
50.98 

 
 
45.36 
 

 
 
42.92 

 
 
49.00 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
40.00 

 
 
4 

 
 
Middle Atlantic Storage 
Drawer 
 
D2 
 

 
 
 
 
$106.00 

 
 
 
 
169.98 

 
 
 
 
106.41 

 
 
 
 
116.05 

 
 
 
 
149.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
108.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Middle Atlantic Blank Panel, 
1U  
 
Twelve Pack EB1-CP12 
 

 
 
 
 
$66.00 

 
 
 
 
106.98 

 
 
 
 
94.69 

 
 
 
 
75.44 

 
 
 
 
99.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
70.00 

 
 
2 

 
 
Middle Atlantic Blank Panel, 
4u,  
 
Six Pack EB4-CP6 
 
 

 
 
 
 
$68.00 

 
 
 
 
109.98 

 
 
 
 
74.74 

 
 
 
 
77.52 

 
 
 
 
99.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
72.00 
 

 
 
3 

 
 
Yamaha Box Type Powered 
Mixing Console  
 
EMX512SC 

 
 
 
 
$414.00 

 
 
 
 
559.98 

 
 
 
 
468.90 

 
 
 
 
No bid  

 
 
 
 
579.00 

 
 
 
 
459.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
458.00 

 
 
3 

 
 
Yamaha Mounting Brackets 
for EMX512SC 
 
 

 
 
 
 
$42.00 
 

 
 
 
 
54.98 

 
 
 
 
52.94 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
49.00 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
No bid 

 
 
 
 
35.00 
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